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Part I: Teaching

(:24). K- Yes, good morning, good day to you as 
usual. Wherever, and wherever you listen to this 
series of Knowledge Seekers, programs from 
Keshe Foundation Spaceship Institute. We 
welcome you back, and open heartedly we bring 
you all the love and care from the universe (U) as 
we start becoming part of U Community. At least 
learn how to be. In the session of last Friday, 
trying to elevate the Soul of the victims of child 
abuse with the member of KF Knowledge Seekers 
(KS) who were there, 
(:26). we started a tentative touch as was said in 
the Intro, we start teaching you how to see through
the dimension (D) of the Soul, while you live in 
the D of physicality (P). In a way, we start 
teaching you to what you are used to as a dream to
sleep. It will become reality in the daily life. It's 
like having 2 different mobile phones in your 
hand, one for one, and one for the other. And this 
is important for KS to learn. And important for 
humanity to learn. That you need .. become aware 
of the change. You need to come to be aware of 
what you need to do and you need to understand 
the Totality. In a way, you got to learn how to 
understand you have 2 facets, 2 D in the life, the 
physicality (P) and the Soul, and how to 
collaborate, 
(:28). and how to bring the 2 to be as normal as 
daily physical life you learned. In a way, what we 
need to understand is, how we gradually become 
to see in both dimensions, and trust it, and don't 
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call it a dream. And learn to coordinate, be it from 
the Soul side, or the Physicality (P) side. For those
of you who were in the session of last Friday, and 
those of you who have registered for the session 
for tomorrow, will go through this process. Will 
come to understand this process. Will see how it 
will be. (silence) And to understand the change. To
become part of a normal life, to live in both 
dimensions. 
(:30). How would we come to live with both, in 
both dimensions? Come to be part of both, in both 
dimensions? And once we can do this, once we 
arrive in the dimension of the Soul, in a given 
position, then through the same process, we can 
call the dimension of physicality to manifest itself. 
And we need to go through this training. We need 
to go through this dimension. And as we started 
last Friday, and how we can see behind two 
curtains. We learned that when we are in the 
dimension of physicality, the first curtain is the 
dimension of physicality, the trees, the car, the 
person we talk to. And when we raise the second 
curtain, we see, we interact with the Soul of the 
person, with the soul of the entity. And as we have 
a common denominator in both structures, we 
decide what is the best for both Souls to be in a 
given position or interaction. This process, as you 
see, is not going to be an easy job. This process of 
switching between the Souls will be taught to the 
first 25 people who will join us in the first sessions
of the 200. 
(:32). And this will be developed into the next 
sessions of the teaching and understanding. It has 
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to be taught face to face in the first instances till 
more and more people learn how you raise the 
second curtain to see the dimension of the Soul. It 
is part of understanding the structure and 
existence. It's not really opening an eyelash and 
you see the daylight. You could have your 
eyelashes closed and see in the dimension of the 
Soul. But the dimension of Physicality to you is 
closed. When you open the eyelashes, then you see
the dimension of Physicality. And this is what we 
said in all the teachings, you cannot lie. You will 
not be able to lie in that dimension, because you 
see both. You are aware of both. And this will 
become one of the biggest challenges for man. 
Because physicality cannot do something wrong 
where it's aware of the Soul is with it. Physicality 
cannot cheat, physicality cannot bring the 
dimension of what I call, "what suits me better, 
forget the others." So in this sense we come to 
understand and in the training to come, to live in 
both dimensions. 
(:34). Then we'll learn we do not need to sleep to 
dream. We'll live the dream of reality at the same 
time. The first times you try this it's not easy. The 
first time you try to, as I call, raise the "second 
curtain" which is opens up during your time of 
sleep and you call it a dream, it's not an easy job. 
Because it brings a lot of confusion. What am I 
seeing? In the dimension of physicality I see the 
door, the car, the man, the dog, the cat. Here I see 
just light, dark lights, with the stars, with different 
dimension and shapes and colors of the stars. And 
those dimensions when interact with the physical 
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dimension changes into personalities, the mom, 
the dad, the dog. And then we come to understand 
we see beyond. You get on the phone in a physical 
dimension to the man on the other side in India 
trying to sell you an item, which he knows is 
wrong. But now you learn to go through the 
dimension of Physicality and you see his Soul 
says, no, the Physicality is wrong, what he's 
saying. Then you know the truth. You don't need to
wait to buy the product and then find out, "oh, the 
guy lied to me." This is part of the process of the 
elevation of the Soul of the Man (STM). 
(:36). Part of the process that how we learn to 
elevate ourselves. Does not need no Prophet, and 
no Ayatollah, and no Mullahs and no priest. Then 
it comes to the point that you reach to understand 
that you read, you go to the Church and he says, 
this is what Christ did, blah, blah, blah, blah. You 
switch in the Church to the dimension of the Soul 
and put yourself at the level of the Soul of 
Understanding to the Soul of the Christ. And you 
ask, “did you do such a thing?” And then you find 
out what is the truth. And then that's the time that 
we say, you put the book down and you walk out 
of the Church. Because you don't need no false 
intermediaries. This is the beauty of it. It's the 
same when you stand in front of the lover, and the 
lover tells you, he or she loves you. But actually, 
the Soul and the physicality is engaged with 
another Soul and physicality. Just passing time. 
Then there is no other way to live, but the ways of 
Mitra. Because when you talk, you act, and you 
think, it's all the same. Because you are aware that 
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the truth is seen by the Souls. But the interesting 
part for you as Knowledge Seekers, which we 
started last Friday session, is how do I do this? 
(:38). How do I reach this point to be able to raise 
the second curtain? And be able to ?? live in the 
dimension of physicality? This goes back to what I
always said, "Man lives a schizophrenic life. In 
two characters.” One the character of physicality, 
and the other one, the night shift character, we call 
it, a dream. How do you do this? How do you 
develop this seeing, observation, and the trust in 
both, and live both. As the women always say, we 
are "multitasking." This time the multitasking is 
the same for the man and the woman, because the 
task is to coordinate within the Soul and the Soul 
of Physicality (STP), which brings the dimension 
of physical life into it. We ask those who 
participated last Friday, to carry on with the same 
process to this Friday, when we meet tomorrow. 
And we bring that process into Totality. Many of 
you, if you develop that point, if you develop that 
strength, you should be able to see the Soul of 
abusers. Some of it might bring you physical 
tension, some of it might bring you physical 
pleasure, that you manage to move someone to do. 
And then, would that be part of the work he start 
learning? Then do you need to sleep to see the 
dimension of the Soul and call it a dream? And the
interesting thing is, 
(:40). would the time comes that, the dream and 
the reality will coexist and happen at the same 
time? And that it's the time, if you reach that point,
it's the time when you meet your Creator. Because,
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it's existence in both dimensions. This means you 
will see the Soul of Physicality of the Creator and 
Mitra at the same time. And very few in the 
Universe have ever managed to reach that level. 
Very few. It is not an impossible task, but it's 
understanding the Totality of the work. And does 
not need no intermediary. We don't tell you to 
listen to us to do this, and that, and that, and that, 
that you'll see and you get this, and this and that, 
and you'll get to your heaven, or you get to 
"resurrection," and you get to the Creator, and the 
rest of that, what I call, rubbish, which has been 
put on the table. You decide. You are the beginning
and you are the end. You see both dimensions, you
see both physicality's. And the interesting thing 
will be, a lot of you will not talk about, "oh, I 
thought about it and it happened." No, I talk about 
it, I taught about it, and it did happen, because my 
Soul brought the STP, to get the physicality to 
what the Soul wants, and in another point, 
(:42). the STP gets the Soul to do what the STP 
and the physicality wants. You don't need to write 
a letter to the lover to say, "I love you." You pass 
that to the STP and to the STM, and the lover says,
"I know you love me and I love you too." The 
speaking word become less, and understanding the
emotion and the fields of the life becomes more. 
And then you don't say, "oh, I was just thinking 
about this a few minutes ago and you talked." 
Because a few minutes ago what you thought, 
maybe initiated by the partner, and you responded 
to it, and then you think it was my thought, but 
both think the same. When you meet your true 
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lover, true partner, true, what I call, Soul mate, it's 
the time when you reach that point. The speaking 
word becomes that rose flower to confirm the 
confirmation of the Soul's conversation. Then it 
comes the same in reverse. When you hug each 
other in the Soul and you find the physicality hugs 
too. Then, there is no argument, then there is no 
misunderstanding,
 then there is no, "if that, was it, is it, it happened, 
it's coincidental." You sent a message to the Soul, 
"I want to hug." and you find your partner hugs 
you physically, you don't need to ask, "how 
come?" Because it's become what you become, 
(:44). and what you, how you want it. And this is 
part of the progress of the Man in the coming time.
Then you decide, I travel in the airplane, or a 
spaceship, or I travel in the ?? shape of the STM, 
and all will be the same. We started this process to 
gradually to introduce you, to watch, to see, to 
understand, the operation and closeness of the two.
And it goes back to last week's teaching, where 
when you understand this, then you use the 
emotion to direct. You go in this opening of what I 
call, the second curtain, to the Soul of the mom, 
but then you want to bring the dad into it as well, 
but the emotion of the love in the level of the Soul 
brings you the threesome. Where one has passed 
away years ago, and the other one is in another 
part of the world, and you are on the other side, 
but the Souls meet and they feel the physical 
touch. As the STP present, creates that emotion of 
reality. Same as what you see in the dream, but 
this process will take time for Man to understand. 
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How you open that curtain? With the physicality 
we open our eyelashes, and it opens, we see the 
dimension of physicality. How do we open the 
second curtain, that through the same eyes we see 
both at the same time, and feel the emotion of the 
two? 
(:46). The emotion is the only connection between 
the STM and the STP, and when they become one, 
then you see everything at the same time. You see 
a man standing in front of you and you're aware 
and see the STM within the man. And then you 
feel, you see if what is spoken in the dimension of 
physicality is the same as what the Soul says. And 
then you understand the level of sincerity. This has
happened to me many thousands of times, when I 
stand in front of the people and I hear a lie, and I 
see the Soul telling me, "this is a lie." And, you do 
not need to be present in the dimension of 
physicality to understand it. Many of these 
occasions stays with me very fresh, because I 
could see the Soul and I could see the physicality. 
And in one occasion, the physicality noticed that 
I'm aware of the truth and claimed, "I will jump 
off the balcony," because I cannot hide the truth 
from you. This is the way the truth is, this is the 
way you learn, because you look at the person in 
dimension of physicality, then you open the 
second eye, you open the same eye in a second 
energy level. It's not an eyelash, it's like you create
a transparent curtain open, that the light can shine, 
the light of the Soul can shine through. And in the 
interaction, you see the color of the eye. 
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(:48). You see the color of the Soul, and then you 
understand. It's not easy, but you have to learn if 
you want to live the dimension of Universal life. 
Because many lives have no dimension of 
physicality but energies. And then you have to 
understand what that energy wants from you. And 
if you understand that, the biggest question will 
come for the Man, would be a place and a position
for a virus, for example. As it's an energy pack 
with its own intellect, with its own Soul. And you 
know it's there, it can harm you, or it can come to 
you. And then it comes to understand, do I need 
to? To share, or to give, or do I decide that I... that 
the touch will become my own demise? Then it 
comes to something very interesting, which I put 
to you, in one of the teachings in the past, but 
maybe today you understand. And in some of the 
teachings I refer to it in a very tentative way. 
Viruses are energy packs, which attach to Amino 
Acid (AA). They exist in the dimension of the 
Universal Community, where the physicality does 
not exist, as we have no AA. That it can be 
contaminated in the Universe and we get bacteria's
and the rest. Then the question comes for many of 
you. Why for example, some of you never got the 
Corona? 
(:50). And some of you did, and you battled with 
it. And some of you, you know, become submitted 
to it and gave the physicality to it. Did those who 
did not get the Corona, in the Soul level 
understood the share of the energy, and in that 
level never came in touch with. Then are some of 
you who got the Corona and shared the dimension 
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of the energy of the virus. Agreed to share but, I 
stay alive and you take what you like. The 
question is, ?? a few points will rise for Man, 
because this is how you will interact in the space. 
Energy packs which have intelligence, energy 
packs which are in the dimension of the Soul, and 
the STP is within them. Do I need to interact with 
you? And would your interaction with me brings 
my demise? Or we can come to a point that you 
can take what you need from me, what I need from
you. But at the end, we both separate with our own
energies. Many of you who went through the 
Corona case, and it touched and it killed some of 
the cells of your body, as you call it, you have 
shared the Soul of the cell of the Corona with you, 
and you dispersed it in different shapes from your 
body. You rejected it in different forms from your 
body. What happened to that Soul of the Corona? 
(:52). If you understand this, we even come to 
understand how viruses on this planet and the 
universe extend, expand and divide. And how we 
can even stand the strongest plasmatic fields, 
could be the Soul of another man, we call it a 
virus, to interact with. All viruses, what we call, 
energy packs, are non-dimensional. They are 
without dimension. And some are still Soul of 
other creatures travel in the span of Universe, 
where the dimension of the STP is within them. 
Would they change and manifest in dimension of 
physicality within us? What we call today as 
parasites, in the dimension of physicality. Would 
we allow to do this? If you go back to the 
teachings of many years ago, I refer to the time 
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when the Man will trust his Soul with the captain. 
And when he arrives at the point of destination, 
he's released to take the shape of his manifestation.
Now you understand what that means. Where you 
are as a Soul, and the STP, within another energy 
pack, we call it, the womb of the mother, the 
womb of the Earth, the womb of the Creation, all 
within the Soul of another creature, to carry us 
across, because they carry the higher strength to a 
deeper strength, higher level in the Universe, and 
deliver us to that point. We call them captains in 
the dimension of physicality. 
(:54). We call them whatever you like, in the 
dimension of the Soul. Where these Souls carry 
and possess much higher strength in what they 
call, the shield, the cover, the package of their 
Soul, that they can accommodate both. Their own 
Soul, the Soul of the others, and when it comes to 
the point of destination, they can allow to go. 
What happen if you take the shape of physicality 
while you are in that cocoon within their trust, 
within their Soul? You become parasites to their 
life, to their existence, to their Soul. Man will 
learn a lot about these things. Man has no choice. 
And as I said to you, we have started the process 
of colonization. And as we hear in the past week, 
the Chinese announced the same in the past week, 
that they will start the colonization, and mining, 
and living on the Moon. I do not think the two are 
coincidental. You understand, we carry the 
knowledge and we come to understand more. And 
we talk through the word of the Man. And as I 
always said, we let the governments speak in what 
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is agreed with the Keshe Foundation. In their own 
way, to make it the national pride. In their own 
way, that it brings advancement to knowledge of 
the Man. Elevation of the Soul, elevation of 
understanding, the Totality of the knowledge has 
to be passed on through the Soul, 
(:56). and not in the dimension of physicality. 
When you come to dimension of physicality, you 
need the schools, translators, educators and the 
rest. When it comes to the level of the Soul, it's 
shared in the dimension of the fields of the 
Universe. And the knowledge is free and open to 
every Man. "I made Man in the image of Myself." 
And now I show my image, as a Soul. And it's for 
Man to decide in what monkey suit he decides to 
manifest himself. Black, white, blond, dog, cat and
the rest. Try to understand, try to comprehend the 
knowledge of the two coexisting within the same 
structure of the dimension of physicality. Then, 
when the time comes, you allow the Soul to take 
over, and when the time comes, you allow the 
physicality to take over. And then, there's one 
interesting point. Would the dimension of the 
physicality and the STP, when is within the cocoon
of the Soul, still have that tangibility of the 
physicality of the brain of the Man? Or, does that 
entity changes into the fields, which is connected 
to the STP, weak enough, with no dimension of 
connection, in a way, with the STM? 
(:58). Then, one point which comes for those who 
understand this process, in a later time, in a deeper
way, when we put the STM, which carries the STP
within it, which carries the physicality within it, 
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would they see a brain structure? Or would they 
see a brain as a structure of fields? The second 
shall be ?? converted, to be correct. Then this way,
no matter state within the physical brain of the 
Man will ever appear in a dimension of the AA 
protein of the Man, beyond the dimension of this 
planet, where the STP can be endangered. In a 
way, our brain will change into the field, plasmatic
dimension, once it goes within the structure of the 
STM, as is cocooned. Then you understand. Man 
in every dimension, when it comes to the 
dimension of physicality, will take the control 
system center of what we call the brain, in a 
dimension of physical state, matter of the time, 
place and position. This way it guarantees its 
physical manifestation in any dominion and any 
position in the Universe. This is how you will
 travel in the dimension of the Soul from New 
York to Tehran. And Tehran and its atmospheric 
condition of the Earth will manifest, is the same. 
The Soul has a picture structure of the origin. You 
manifest yourself the way you are. Then mother 
knows, "oh, you just arrived from New York, this 
is my daughter." Or, you decide to change shape, 
and knock on the door and say, 
(1:00). "I have come to see you." And then, the 
shape and the emotion of the Soul will confirm to 
the mother, "this is my daughter." It's interesting 
when the physicality changes, but the Soul sees 
through. I have tested this a few times and it's 
amazing what it does, and how it manifests itself. 
Does not matter what shape and color you 
manifest yourself in. Now it comes to the point. In 
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how you as Knowledge Seekers and those who 
listen to these teachings in the coming time, learn 
to switch. Learn to raise the second curtain as I 
call it. Or in a way create and go through the 
shield magnetic fields of the second curtain. If you
go back to the teachings in many simple ways, I 
have explained to you about when you go to sleep,
your blood pressure, your magnetic field of your 
blood, reduces in the strength, which allows the 
Soul to expand, and pass through, and become the 
interaction of the Souls you call it, a dream. 
(1:02). Now you understand the worth, the work, 
and beauty of the STP. Where through the 
interaction of the Soul with the STP, you open that 
curtain. The first curtain is your eyelashes in the 
physical. The second curtain is the field strength of
the STP, the Spirit of the Man. And when you 
become in unison, when you learn this, through 
the wishes of the Soul and the true understanding 
of the STP, the second curtain will open. This will 
take time for Man to learn. One is the dimension 
of two fields? And one is the wish in the 
dimension of the field, and matter state motion of 
the eyelash? Then you understand when the wish 
is sincere, the second curtain opens automatically, 
even if the first is still closed in the dimension of 
physicality. The time of sleep. Mankind needs to 
understand this, and mankind needs to be aware of
the Totality of the existence of both. Then you 
come to understand, then you become wise, 
(1:04). then you start the process of living a true 
life of the Man, a true dimensionless, a true 
passengers of the Universe, a true way that many, 
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many of you wish to have, that you don't call it a 
dream, and the dream becomes a reality of 
physicality to walk. In a way, you open the eye of 
physicality, while you understand and control the 
dimension of the strength of the fields of the STP, 
which takes that curtain away, and allows the Man 
to see at the same time. One of these occasions, 
which I remember clearly, happened a few years 
ago. In Austria, I stood in front of the person and 
she lied. She noticed she lied. And the only option 
she had, was to take the dimension of physicality 
and claim. Because, you cannot lie through the 
Soul, when you see through the Soul. This is how I
knew, it's been adultery and betrayal. Because the 
STP spoke different than the STM. And the, what I
call, the doer became aware of the wrongdoing, 
and cannot lie. You see this more and more, you 
understand this if you practice it more and more. 
(1:06). And then you come to understand you don't
need no Enhancement Unit (EU) and you don't 
need no Spaceship. You come to understand, I can 
raise both and see both. And you come to 
understand that the word, "oh, I was just thinking 
about this before you say it", is that I send you the 
message through my Soul and now it confirmed 
you received the message. It's like confirmation of 
email has been received. And then you can extend 
this with your lover, with your partner, with your 
child, with your friend. And verbal language, it 
becomes a pleasure of confirmation of the 
understanding. Verbal language becomes a 
sweetener in the dimension of physicality. It 
becomes that message in a bottle, which has been 
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read and responded to. But this time the message 
you send in the bottle of the Soul was received by 
the soul in the rescue with all the comfort. 
Mankind has a lot to learn. Mankind has to 
become aware of its existence in both dimensions. 
And not to be afraid of it, and not to shy away 
from it, and not to use it as a tool to feel supreme 
and call himself a prophet. 
(1:08). Why we brought these teachings and this 
subject up is very easy. As you are learning to 
become the passengers of the Universe. As now 
you are learning as we start teaching you last 
Thursday, last Friday, about opening the second 
eye, in a way opening the Soul. When you come 
across and when you take your position in 
dimension that your Soul is aware of the other 
Soul existence, but they don't have the knowledge 
that you carry, you don't call yourself prophet, and 
you don't claim anymore and you don't dictate by 
it. The way the South Americans were waiting for 
the Messiah with a blonde, blue eye, when the man
appeared, mistakenly they gave everything up and 
they become to be the slave to it. You become 
equal, and in that point you learn to be correct. In 
that point you we give the knowledge of the 
Universe you have to them unconditionally. Then 
no one can claim to be the guardian of the God 
with the rules to kill for it. To keep themselves 
supreme. When we stand in front of the world 
leaders, from religious to power, they have no 
dimension and dominium, as we see through their 
Soul. How can an Ayatollah tells me he is the 
Messenger, where we see through the Soul. If the 
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hand of the man has committed to one killing, he 
has lost that position. Even his own Soul, even his 
own suicide and commitment to it. This is why 
suicide is forbidden, as it does not allow the 
elevation of the Soul. 
(1:10). Then, you understand why it's been said, 
that no Man will take the crown of leadership, as 
in leadership you have to decide on the lives of the
Man. Then we understand, how the process has to 
be. Then you understand that there is no king and 
no leaders as we are all equal, as we king, and 
control and lead our own Soul to its, what I call, 
the final destination. And if we reach that purity 
we manage to see the Soul of our Creator, and the 
physicality of the Mitra ?? is a Universe. "I made 
Man in the image of Myself." If your Soul is in the
center and the interaction with dimension of the 
fields, manifests itself as a STP, and then the 
physicality of you, then you understand the Soul of
the Creator is within, and the interaction of the 
fields of itself, leads to the manifestation of what 
we call, the STP, which is the essence of emotion, 
and the physicality which is Mitra. As it said in 
Arabic, << Arabic Language >>. This is the 
beginning and the end. As by dimension of the 
physicality, we bring the essence of the 
confirmation of the Soul to be within, as there is 
no physicality if the Soul was not there to radiate, 
and create the emotion. Then, in so many ways, 
(1:12). we understand why we manifest ourselves 
in different color, races, and size and shapes. And 
it comes from the love of the Creator, and from his
giving. Then you understand, when we meet with 
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the world leaders, when we meet with the religious
leaders they'll take their turbans off and they 
confirm themselves to be a man and not anything. 
We shall see in the coming time the defrocking of 
all the religious leaders as we meet them one by 
one, and the world leaders to confirm their power 
to be none compared to what is of the Creator. 
Then there shall be no leaders and no kings, as 
every king is the king of the STM. Now try to 
understand and try to practice, because it’s not us 
anymore, it’s you and us as you and your own Soul
and the STP in the dimension of the physicality of 
the man. As we are no prophets, we are just 
teachers. We teach you the way, it’s for you to 
bring the prophet to the existence of your Soul and
its expansion and its elevation. How you will 
achieve this, is something for you. How you will 
extend to understand this, 
(1:14). Is again is in the dimension of the life of 
you, and not us. We just show the path. It's for you
to find the way to stay on the path, the correct way.
There are no punishment, there are no heavens and
there are no hell. It's just how closer with your 
actions you get to be closer to the Soul of the 
Creator. Then try, close your physical eye. And 
then try to bring the emotion within you, that 
interacts with your Spirit, or what you call, the 
STP. That through, you see the light of the Soul. 
Then, you will see darkness. Because you have to 
go through the passage of the extension of the Soul
of yourself. That's normal. If you stay on course, 
you will see the first lights, the first shining Souls. 
And then you open up to a new dimension. And 

19



then you'll hear every knowledge in the Universe, 
and every voice in the Universe. And then, as you 
connect in the dimension of the fields of the 
Universe, you can choose. The mother, the friend, 
the lover, or whatever, even the Soul of the person 
in front of you, lying to you. 
(1:16). The process is very easy. Man has the tool 
to allow the opening of the second curtain. You 
call it, a heartbeat. You call it, the clarity of the 
feeling and emotion. And it comes at the point of 
servitude. I open my Soul to give, to bring. I don't 
open my Soul to take and to steal. And it's very 
much like you see if the light is white coming to 
you, or you see the light …

 << Mr. Keshe connection dropped here because 
he had to answer a call >> 

(1:18). I'm sorry I'm back, I had to accept a very 
important call for the Foundation. Now you 
understand the process, and now you understand 
how you have to do it. 
(1:20). You have many, many ways to raise, or to 
open, or make it transparent, it doesn't matter what
word you put to it, to see through the Soul. In the 
physical dimension, you have the "eye holes" and 
the body has got used to it. It's a less resistance
 point of field transformation. When you are in 
another dimension, when you're in another 
position, you might not have eyelashes. You might
not have the position of the skull to block. 
According to the time and position and the place, 
it will be different. But once you learn the process,
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it does not matter where you are and how and what
shape you take, you can even be a stone and still 
see through the eye of the Soul of the stone. Does 
not matter how that stone is and how big it is. It 
could be as big as a planet and a star itself. The 
STP, the STM, the Soul of understanding the 
Totality, is the responsibility of every Man on his 
own. And does not need no prophet, and no 
Mullahs, and no Priest, and no Rabbi, to tell you 
the lie to suit them to see through the eyes, that 
they can steal from your Soul. 
(1:22). The way you have to learn is the way to 
understand the work of your physical life. To 
understand why you don't dream all the time, and 
why you dream sometimes, and why you dream of
certain people, certain times, and not the times you
want. And how sometimes you always are in 
touch, but you wait for a physical confirmation. 
One of our Knowledge Seekers who we know very
well, sent me a picture with a feather on a book, 
very recently. And says, this is, I know how she 
communicates with me every time I ask 
something. Something appears that it confirms for 
me that she's listening to me and she understands. 
And my answer has been, it's you who have denied
yourself to see it. So she sent it to you in the 
dimension of physicality. Understand the 
physiology of the Man. Do you need to be asleep 
to let your Soul go? Or how come in the 
dimension of the time of what you call, sleep, the 
dream comes. Sometimes we do it during the 
daytime and they call it, "oh, he's a daydreaming." 
Should we change this? It’s the Soul working, 
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(1:24). and not a daydreaming. It's not a dream, it's
the reality of the time and the space, where the 
physical condition of the body of the Man in the 
magnetic field strength of the given time and 
position allows the opening of the second curtain. 
We call it, the second vision, but in fact it's the 
interaction of the STM with the dimension of the 
other Souls. We have created many names for the 
same action, as the Man has done for gravity, 
salinity, pH, and the rest of it. If you understand 
this, and we are to understand the process of how 
we can coexist and create the motion and the 
removal, or a movement of the eyelashes, at the 
same time as the time of the Soul interaction, then 
we understand, we live both. In the world of 
science, we do this when we are born. We do this 
till one or two years old. But the scientists have 
not understood, and they connect it to different 
chemicals in the brain of the child. If you speak or 
if you have observed a child, 
(1:26). you see the child does not flicker their eyes
so much. They don't speak, but when you speak to 
someone who is doing something wrong or the 
brain, the physical dimension is processing things, 
they tend to flick their eyelashes. Children, babies,
infants don't do that much. And they call it. it's 
dopamine in the brain which causes it, because 
they don't understand that the child and the infants,
not having the language of the Man, 
communicates through the Soul. And for that 
purpose, his eyes stay open, and the Soul 
transparency teaches it. In many teachings I 
referred to how infants speak to each other, how 
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they understand who is higher, who is lower, who 
understands more. One could be Chinese, and one 
English, and one could be African and one could 
be South Americans. You put these children of the 
same age, of 8 months, 10 months, 6 months, in 
one room, 2 days in one room, and you see, they 
interact, they communicate, they know, because 
they do that through the Soul. And the doctor says,
"children don't flick their eyes so much, infants, 
because dopamine, something else, has not been 
created in the brain fully." Is that actually what is 
blocking the Man to see, to allow the STM to 
extend beyond the physicality? 
(1:28). Have we known the cause of our 
imprisonment of our Soul with the chemicals 
created by the dimension of physicality, and we 
never understood how it works? Does that level 
changes when we sleep? Or does that level 
changes when we have fears? Or when we are in 
love to see. We sit in the office in the back of the 
chair and our heart and our love fields smells the 
lover across the world. Then we know the way, 
how to pass, to go through the second curtain, 
what I call, through the dimension of the STP, that 
the STM is ??. When the two levels are equal, 
there is no interaction, and one can pass through 
the other. When the STP does not lie to the STM, 
there is no interaction, there is openness. Think 
good. The first rule of Mitra. Because when you 
think good, then you can talk good, and you can 
act good (in Persian language). Perfection. Then 
you see, the Universe is open to the Man, and Man
has been the Man of the Universe, from the second
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of establishment and the existence of his Soul. 
Man has denied that with the eyelashes of the 
physicality. You've been the passengers of the 
Universe from the time of inception. 
(1:30). But you chose the dimension of physicality,
and the eyelashes, and the nations, and the planet, 
to be your prison, to be the prisoner of your 
physicality. In Arabic, they have a beautiful say. 
But it needs changing in one sentence. Every time 
they pray 17 times a day. And he said, 
<< Arabic Language >>. I swear by Almighty, that
Muhammad is a Messenger of God. Change the 
Muhammad to your Soul. Then you are the 
Messenger of your own Soul, and no one else. And
the structure of the ?? Assam is complete. It's the 
hundredth word, which is what ?? ?? was 
promised, one day will be understood. This is the 
attribute of existence. And then you understand the
completion of the cycle of Man, 
(1:32). as he has been part of Universal 
Community, but he denied it ?? with his 
physicality. In a way, the STM should have taken 
the Man in a physical dimension and shown him 
the Universe. In a way, as you punish me and you 
keep me the same, when I'm free I'm not taking 
you with me. You can dream of it. With the 
teachings of today and in the past years, now you 
bring the two together. And you understand the 
elevation of the STM by Man himself. As he does 
not need no ??, no messengers. As one is the 
messenger of the other, no one lies to the other. As 
the STP cannot lie to the STM, as both use the 
same strength of the fields of the Universe within 
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them. We go for a break, we come back. And 
during the break time, try to see if you can raise 
the second (curtain). The barrier you created for 
yourself, and no one else. And you're the only one 
who can open that second curtain, which is the 
clarity between the STM and the STP. Then you 
will see both dimensions. We go for a break. We 
come back. and we'll see how we can understand 
more. Thank you very much Rick, if you can take 
us to a break. 

(1:34). << BREAK >>> 488 KSW June 1 2023

Part II: Q&A

(1:37). K- Yes, yes we are ready to go. 
Q: .. My daughter had her wisdom tooth extracted 
and it is in perfect state. My question is, can I 
make Gans from this wisdom tooth of my daughter
with the purpose of making Gans patches to help 
other people that have problems in their teeth, such
as loss of tooth enamel, bone loss, etc? 
K- How do you answer this? 
(1:38). No, but yes. In a way you can, but, as we 
understand. I'll put it this way, I hope your 
daughter has a nice Soul, and a nice STP, that by 
the creation of this Gans, the best parts goes to 
those who receive it. If I can explain it that way. 
This is part of ... You know, in certain cultures and 
certain ways of thinking, they don't allow any 
pieces of your body to be taken by any way, shape 
or form. As they think, oh, they can do something 

25



with it, and manipulate it or whatever. And, there 
should be no reason, why not? But, there should be
every reason, why? And, this is what we face 
many, many times, especially in past recent time, 
with our doctors, which people come to them with 
very complicated emotional conditions. Where, I 
was present in one of these conversations and, our 
doctors in the background, they know what I'm 
talking about, they were there. Where the brother 
wants to give life back to another brother who's 
been in coma for a long time. But he went into 
coma when he was very, very young, very young 
age. 
(1:40). And now he's in double figure, past long 
time. And I put to them one moral question. I said, 
"you want the brother back." The technology of 
the Keshe Foundation can give that position. But 
the morality, the moral question for you to ask is, 
would a child who's been in less than a handful of 
years when he went to coma, and now is in 
twenties, thirties, or whatever, would not come to 
blame himself why. And then later on, coming out 
of coma, seeing the evolution and where he should
have been, maybe, whatever, he'll commit suicide, 
because he cannot take the change. He cannot cope
with what is in front of him. And do we have that 
right to create that condition? With the new 
technology, with the new power in the hand of the 
doctors, with the hand of the Knowledge Seekers, 
who truly know, and understand how to use the 
knowledge. The question of morality comes first, 
which means the position of the Soul. In the matter
language we call it, morality. In the dimension of 
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the Soul we call it, the responsibility of the Soul. 
We are responsible for that Soul. And, if we bring 
that position, if you put somebody who went in 
coma in the age of 20, 30, and you want to bring 
them out of coma in 40 or 50, they have 
experience, they know how to handle life. But, 
how do you give life, which you know you have 
the knowledge, back to a physical condition, 
which is in maturity of 20, 30 years old. 
(1:42). When he went into coma, when he was less
than a handful of years, and
 how will cope with the surrounding, with the life, 
and the blames, why me, what happened, and I'm 
not there. He is a man, a mature man, everybody 
else that he's seen has children, and he's there with 
the mentality of five years old. Not being able to 
cope, will bring them to different problems. Now 
we have the knowledge to bring the physicality 
back. What is the responsibility of our doctors? 
What is the morality? What is the science of the 
new knowledge? Do we elevate them through the 
Soul, that the Soul brings in that knowledge? Or, 
we can bring them to understand, the lack of time 
in between, or lapse of time in between, has no 
meaning. Because, this has a question mark on this
planet, for us, in the physical dimension. But it 
brings us to another position. When we are young 
STM, and we land on the planet Zeus, with the 
maturity of morality of understanding of the 
knowledge of much higher. Are we that infant? 
And when we land in another place where we see 
them like nomads and we know about the jet 
technology and the computers, do we see 
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ourselves higher? And how do we interact with the
Soul of these creatures? It's not us anymore, it's 
understanding the responsibility of the STM and 
the STP of the man. And what physicality will 
manifest that fits the time, place and position. 
(1:44). When you use a tooth of a teenager, should 
it be kept for the teenager in the future, if she 
needs. As it carries the characteristics and part of 
the Soul of that person. It's very interesting, when 
you speak about the STP, and you speak about the 
wisdom tooth, and you speak about dimension of 
physicality. What is the position of your wisdom 
tooth? Isn't it the closest to your Soul, the wisdom 
of understanding? Is there a wisdom in what we 
call it, the wisdom tooth? And, would we carry the
characteristics of that wisdom, when we make a 
Gans and you want to use it on the others? It's a, 
what I call, with the new knowledge we didn't 
have this problem till you put the question on the 
table. But, it's not a problem, is understanding the 
situation. Understanding that it's not just a tooth 
anymore, because that tooth, and the word of 
Bahá'u'lláh, bless his name, is a physical 
dimension, is a matter state and he has a Soul. And
that Soul is created through the interaction of the 
STP, and the Soul of the person together. We do 
heart transplantation, we do liver transplant. Now 
with Gans’s, do we do a Soul transplant? Now you
understand. 
(1:46). This is why in the Keshe Foundation 
development stage, we have moved away from the
Soul, from physical materials, into the dimension 
of the fields. Then, we are open, we are not 
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connected. This is what I tell you, you don't even 
have 5% of the knowledge of the where the Keshe 
Foundation development is. Because we cannot 
explain to you, we understand this, we understood 
this, and we are in the level of interaction of the... 
This is what I keep on telling you, don't look at the
MaGravs, you're just looking after 20% saving, 
but you miss the 100% which is sitting there for 
elevation of your Soul. You breathe the air to take 
the energy from it to elevate your Soul. You eat the
food to take energy from it. With them your body 
of the Man, the physical dimension, muscle, is 
connected with copper. We made the MaGravs 
from the copper, which fastens the elevation of the
STP, to elevate the STM. And you're still looking 
for that 20% waste of time energy of physicality. 
The structure of the copper comes from the Soul of
the Earth, Soul of the Universe. And you're still 
looking for that 20%, 30% energy saving, where 
you have denied your Soul from the opening to the
Universe. You feed yourself with the matter state, 
(1:48). I gave you the resources, the basis to get 
that energy for your Soul, and you're still after that
winding, left and right. Maybe you understand. 
You know, you give the most beautiful toy to a 
child, and it still plays with the box. And the 
MaGrav systems for you is that box. You haven't 
understood how to play with the toy. With the new 
knowledge, as Knowledge Seekers, you have to 
learn to look at the broader spectrum, the Totality, 
and not to fit the physicality. And, you do the heart
transplant, and people say, people's character 
changes, because the Soul of the one which 
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created the other, in the heart which is 
transplanted, is moved with it, it's not far from 
reality. Then do you have the right to put that 
wisdom tooth to the others, and transplant part of 
the Soul with it? We are allowed, we are freely 
allowed to do so. But, are those who receiving it, 
are free there to receive it? And is the Soul of that 
tooth, whatever, has reached the point of maturity 
or servitude? Or is it still in the abusive mode? 
Now you understand. As I said, we go to new 
phases of teaching. And these are the facts you 
have to face, from now on. 
(1:50). I didn't know, does not count. Because the 
knowledge is released and you know, it counts. 
You are responsible for it. Any other question? 
Q: .. Good morning Mr. Keshe. You mentioned 
that Jesus learned about transmutation shortly 
before the crucifixion. It is reported in the Bible 
that shortly before, more precisely 40 days before 
his crucifixion, he was with some apostles on a 
mountain and the episode of the transfiguration 
occurred, where Jesus was enveloped in a very 
strong light and Moses and the Prophet Elijah 
appeared at his side and they talked in front of the 
apostles. My question is, would Jesus encounter 
with the Souls of Moses and the Prophet Elijah 
have been the moment when transmutation was 
taught to him? If so, would the apostles have 
understood anything?
 K- They can write whatever they like. It is... many
of us, in the dimension of understanding the 
Totality, only receive the knowledge, 
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(1:52). at the point of need, and not before. 
Because then we affect the course of action. Or we
premeditate not to be. If this was true, if this was 
correct, Jesus would not, never allowed himself to 
get to the cross. He would have mended his ways 
to be able to teach ?? man. But he had a purpose, 
there was a purpose for him to be put on the cross, 
because of whatever. But in a way the knowledge 
comes at a point of understanding and a need. And 
we hear a lot, in the past few years especially, I've 
come to understand more about how different sects
of Christianity interpret the same thing to fit them 
for certain people to be the leaders of that sect. But
in fact, the bottom line of it is there is no truth in 
any of it. It's just how they interpret it to suit them,
to call themselves, Catholic Church, Orthodox 
Church, the Armenians, the Church of, God 
knows, Russia and the rest of it. If the basis is one,
why does it need to be interpreted? But don't 
forget, Christ said himself, "my work will be 
carried by 72 ships." Which means he knew that 
his teachings will find 72 different ways of 
interpretation. 
(1:54). Don't forget, the Bible we read was put 
together 300 years later. So anybody can put 
anything to fit anybody to show it does. The only, 
the only message which is written by the man 
himself, is Bahá'u'lláh's, bless is name. 
Muhammad was written from ?? Hadith 40 years 
later. Nothing we know about the truth how long 
later Moses what you call, the Torah was written a 
thousand years later, 800 years later. And you can 
imagine how many stories changes to be fit what. 

31



And, this time of teaching, you hear, you're part of 
that process of the evolution and interaction. You 
hear the voice, and there's no interpretation to the 
voice. Now you have to understand, this is what I 
said. If you read the book 1, 2 and 3, what you 
read as a second version, second edition, is very 
far from the first edition which I wrote. This was 
edited by somebody who was trying to translate 
the knowledge, the way they understood. We had a
big battle with this lady. We don't want you to 
write what you understand, just translate. If you 
can get hold of the first edition, which is not, it's 
got a lot of English mistakes here and there, 
(1:56). you get the true essence of the knowledge 
we passed on. Which you don't get so much, in 
such a strength in the second edition. We don't 
published the first edition anymore. Very few 
number of people have the first edition. I think 
about a thousand were booked, printed. Then you 
get the true essence of the knowledge. As was with
the MaGravs, right turn, left turn, it's not this, that 
twisted the other way. The lady wanted to change 
the word to fit English, because the look was 
written with one ??, or when it was written, 
because it was to be published past, in ??, and now
"it's looked," has become sight. Now you 
understand the difference. The same is with, we 
don't understand, it does not exist. So, 40 days 
after, 40 days before, resurrection, disappearing, 
and everything else has mutated to, as many 
versions depends which path of the 72 ships you 
sit on. The worst one, the worst of the whole lot, is
the Catholic Church. Because it's nothing but lies, 
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it's nothing but what is changed to suit, the way it 
was built to suit them. If you go back to the 
Armenians and the original orthodox groups, you 
find more, less of dilution and change. The worst 
Bible which is diluted, 
(1:58). which is changed to fit the Emperor and the
servants of the Emperor in the dimension of the 
Soul, is what we call, the present Bible, which in 
Catholic Church promotes so much. Any other 
question? 
Q: .. Good morning Mr. Keshe and all seekers of 
knowledge. When the "second curtain" of reality 
opens, could you guide us on the emotion of 
reality?" Thanks for the guidance. 
K- No, that's your job. Otherwise, we'll become 
another Messengers. You have to, to befit the life 
of Mitra. You have to befit the understanding of 
the "three rules," as it says in the Bible. The three 
kings, the gift from the three kings. That's the king
which means the "crown of the work of the 
Creator," nothing else. Not king as a physicality 
king, king as the rule, king as the principle. If you 
understand that, you'll find out, you become very 
wise very rapidly. 
(2:00). You will see through many, many things. 
But don't fool yourself, "Now I see, I know and 
then I become." The more you see, the more 
humble you have to become. And the point of 
arrogance is the point of receiving. And 
understand one thing, that your job is not talk to 
elevate anymore. Your job is to give to the Soul to 
elevate itself, that it talks itself. This is why, if you 
understand now, why we keep on telling you, "we 
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elevate the Soul of the world leaders, we elevate 
the Soul of the children, we elevate the Soul of the
religious leaders." Because we let them speak the 
word, because we elevated the Soul. When you 
speak by word, you need time to see the president, 
and you'll never get that time. But you can reach 
his Soul instantaneously, if you are sincere to raise
it, not to take from it, or try to dictate to it. We, as I
said, spoke about that you'll see the colonization of
the Moon and everything else. And within a week 
or two now, we see in the Chinese press, that the 
government has announced what we said very 
recently. Do we have somebody who leaks the 
information from inside? Or are we part of the 
information? Cannot be coincidental. There are too
many coincidences in the work of the Keshe 
Foundation and International work. 
(2:02). If you read, as we have received from our, 
what we call, Chinese community, this is the 
announcement by the Chinese government in the 
past few days, as it has been in the Press, which 
reads very easy. It says, at the press conference of 
the Xinjiang, 16 man mission held on May 29th, 
Lin Zheng revealed that recently, the Lunar 
landing in the ?? of Chinese ?? man Lunar 
exploration project, has been launched. And the 
overall goal, is to achieve the first landing on the 
Moon by Chinese by 2030. Carry out lunar 
scientific investigation and related technical 
expertise. Break through the mastery of the key 
technology, such as Man, Earth, Moon round trip, 
short-term residence on the lunar surface, and 
human machines joint exploration. Complete 
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multiple tasks, such as landing, ??, mining, 
research and return. And, as I said to our Chinese 
friends, we'll have the champagne ready for them 
when they arrive. Don't forget, 
(2:04). Chinese are working on the land moon base
colonization in 2030. NASA is working on 2030 
Mars landing, human life. And the head of this 
section of the, what we call, NASA organization, 
is a Knowledge Seeker. And he is a listener to 
these teachings, and most probably he'll say, 
"Keshe, you are not supposed to tell that." But he 
is, he's one of, he supported us heavily with it. But,
NASA has put a banned communication between 
us and them, but not the Chinese. And this comes 
to the back of elevating the knowledge, giving the 
knowledge. And it's just not coincidental, that as I 
said, in the ... Now you understand the work of the
Foundation. Now you understand the work of your
own Soul. There are no coincidences. There are no
coincidences. Very soon, in a very, very short time,
you will see Iranian nuclear physicists in the 
Universities of United States teaching directly 
from Tehran. Because the American nuclear 
physicists, American Space Technologies, are in 
the first class, still sitting, waiting for the bell to 
ring to start learning. Compared to what it is 
within the Chinese and the Iranian Space and 
nuclear technology. And then we understand, then 
we understand we are all equal, because we teach 
through the Soul. 
(2:06). We teach through the understanding of it. 
And this is important for all of us to understand. 
Don't look at, "oh, such and such .. Keshe said 
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such a thing, and now a few weeks later, a few 
days later, it appears." This is how it works. This is
how it's supposed to work. We elevate the Soul of 
the scientists of the nation, not one scientist 
anymore. And this is part of the understanding of 
the man, new dimension of life, which we ignored.
And just because some of us have access to it, 
does not make us special. We are just aware of it. 
And we thank we are aware of it. We're thankful in
the knowledge and the beauty we are given. And 
this is why we called you to join us in the past few 
months, in meeting with the world leaders and the 
rest. Now you understand how it works. Maybe 
you understand how it works. The elevation 
doesn't come by you deciding, the elevation comes
by you sincerely, letting your wish to be there, to 
achieve. Any other question? 
K- .. Let me explain, this is totally... There is a 
point has written in the Iranian government, with 
the Iranian leadership and Iranian administration, 
in respect to Keshe Foundation, and our work with
other nations. Keshe Foundation and its 
management, and as me as head of the Keshe 
Foundation, 
(2:08). we stay loyal to the Iranian nation. And we 
serve the other nations equal. We'll never betray 
Iran. This is the problem you have in your 
leadership, and in the work of the Ayatollah 
Khomeini of Iran, in respect to the part, Keshe 
Foundation, and Mehran Tavakoli Keshe. It’s your 
problem, and not ours. We make this clear, in 
respect to the meetings to take place in the coming
days, that we stay correct and we'll never sell out 
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Iran. As we know we shall not sell any other 
nation, unless we behave and work the same, on 
equal basis, irrespective of nation, color or race. 
My word goes directly to Ayatollah Khomeini of 
Iran, in the process of past 48 hours and the 
meeting to you. Iran stays the same. In respect to 
the Keshe Foundation and our work, does not 
matter what arrangement and agreements we sign 
with the other nations, to see the development of 
the technology. My call goes to the Ayatollah 
Khomeini of Iran and his messengers, and the 
work of Iranian administration. We stay solid in 
supporting Iran in the Space and Defense, and 
we’ll not break rank. Thank you very much. Any 
other question? 
(2:10). Q: .. In terms of the traveling, what's the 
portion of the world population does Keshe 
Foundation foresee to take the physical 
transportation, as opposed to the energy 
transmutation in the future? 
K- It'll be a mixture, it's the decision of each man. 
Physicality has some beauties, traveling with the 
Soul has beauties. It does not mean that you don't 
see things when you travel in the dimension of the 
Soul. You... there is awareness and there is 
confirmation of existence. It's the beauty of 
interaction without ?? painted works of 
physicality. Even though the dimension of Soul 
has it's own problems, it's not problem free. If you 
think, "I travel, I interact with dimension of the 
Soul, that's it." Both have their own beauties and 
their own, what you call, problems. Or interface, 
interaction, understanding, whatever you want to 
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call it. But it'll be choice of the man, and we do 
both. But the beauty of it is, as the STM opens up, 
and the knowledge opens up, now that we start 
teaching to the other races in the Universe, would 
we be happy to choose to only to travel physically 
on the dimension of the Earth, or we travel to 
position and then we change position from the 
Soul to physical dimension travel, or observation? 
(2:12). The interesting part will come for many of 
the travelers of the Universe is, what energies do 
you absorb to elevate your Soul, in, the span of the
Universe? On Earth we eat, we breathe, we give 
love. How do we do that in space? That's another 
chapter of teaching. Are we fast travelers in 
dimension of the Soul? Or do we take position, 
just because we know we can travel fast? These 
are a lot of things, which we have to answer. We 
have no confirmation and no understanding of it. 
Unless we comprehend the Totality of both 
dimensions. Any other question? 
Q: .. My wife is over 60 years young, with the 
physical union of our physical Souls, my wife's 
face is rejuvenated to the age under 20. The skin is
smooth and beautiful. Why? What is happening?" 
Thank you for the answer. 
(2:14). K- First of all, what have you done? Or is it
just to the eye of the beholder? This... the 
physicality, the dimension of physicality, is 
irrelevant how you look. I mean, it's nice to have a
60 year old, 20 year old wife, but won't that 
become a problem for a 60 year old man, to have a
20 year old wife looking but 60. And, as I said, 
when we expand the dimension of the Soul, the 
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physical manifestation become irrelevant. Maybe, 
maybe, when the physicality was age of 20, was 
when the Soul was at peace and happy and in 
balance. Maybe that's what's been achieved. You 
see aging as matter of time, we see aging as a 
matter of maturity of Soul. But, in so many ways, 
if you understand this work and I've referred to it 
before, we've seen that years ago in the clinical 
trials, when we did, how women of 70, 80 went 
back to having the reverse of the menopause. 
Because it wasn't just a physical outside, inside the
body goes for assurance of that I can reproduce 
and give life. Because my life is extended. People 
like... there is a... I think it's a chart somewhere, if 
you can get hold of it on the Internet, you can find 
it. 
(2:16). Nowadays they define, if you are born in 
what decades and how long you live. Children 
born in early 2000, expected to live between 150 
to 200 years. That's average, not everybody lives 
that life. Children born in twenty twenties, 
expected to live in 200 to 500 years physical life. 
People born in sixties and seventies, seen average 
of about 80, 90 years, 100 years. But with the new 
addition of the energy releases and the new 
knowledge of you can absorb energy, would that 
figures of 50, 100 or 500 years matter anymore? 
It's a rotation of Sun and rotation of Earth around 
the Sun. Where in the dimension of the Soul you're
connected to rotation of the Universe, dimension 
of interaction of the fields of the Universe. Would 
some of you live a million years in the physical 
time of the Earth? Would some of you born now, 
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understanding the transformation and transposition
in the dimension of the energies of the Universe, 
will live beyond when the Solar System is already 
demised, through its physical dimension 
interaction. It's quite possible. Not just because the
mother dies, the child has died too. We cannot. 
And these are part of the realities which we'll face,
we have to face. 
(2:18). And with a new knowledge, is open to us. 
Do you still want to live 60 years, work hard, and 
then at 60, 65, said you're on a pension, and you 
got to live on few bits, just enough to a meager 
life, till that point of separation of life comes, you 
call it death, from the ?? you became a pensioner. 
Or, you tap into the elevation of the Soul of the 
Universe, and age of 65 on Earth getting a pension
is a joke. Because, whatever you need, you receive
through your Soul. And, you might live 500 years. 
You can imagine the French government will pull 
his hair out, because they increased the pension by
2 years, and we saw all the riots in France. Now, 
try to increase the pension to 500 years, and then 
you see what happens. There'll be no French 
government left, let alone the citizens. So, it comes
to the maturity of time. We see a lot of changes, 
we see a lot of things with the new knowledge will
change. Be it physical, be it dimension of the Soul,
be it traveling. And as Knowledge Seekers, you 
are already wise to it. You know what is to come, 
because you are the doer, it's not us. It doesn't say, 
"watch the space on Keshe Foundation teaching." 
We watch how you manage to get to the space, in 
your time, that you can teach us. That's why it's 
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called, Knowledge Seekers. And if you have found
a way to change your wife from 60 to 20, 
(2:20). I'm sure there are plenty of ?? like Azar and
the rest, who would like to know the recipe. They 
still like to stay as members of Universal Council, 
because the age does not count in the dimension of
physicality. Any other question? I'll tell you 
something interesting as part of the history of the 
Keshe Foundation, regarding this age business. As 
you know, once you become 60, before 61, you… 
if you are a member of the Universal Council, you 
have to resign to give a space for a new cycle to 
start, a new life, a new, what we call, process of 
elevation of the Soul with a younger Soul. And, 
when we brought this in, one of the members of 
the Universal Council, who thought it's the right to
be there forever, raised a huge objection, "you 
wanted to get rid of me. That's why you brought 
this in.” Not understanding the work of the 
elevation of the Soul. And then becoming the 
dictator, because I've been there first. I've been 
there because I have to. And as you know, she's 
not with us anymore. And this become, God given 
right, because I was there and I'm 60 and 200, I 
still stay member of the Universal Council. In the 
future I explain why we put this in, and you 
understand the reason. Even though your Soul can 
travel the span of the Universe for thousands of 
years. If you are a Universal member, on this 
planet, 
(2:22). 60 is your limit, in the physical dimension 
of the STM. And then you understand why, in the 
teachings to come. So, you can look, 20, but by 
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birth, on the physical dimension, 60, is fantastic. 
I'm sure, they would like to know the cream 
mixture. Any other question? 
Q: .. Mr. Keshe, the purpose that Jesus went 
willingly to the cross, would this be to demonstrate
the different levels of awareness, and to 
demonstrate the renunciation of the physical body?
K- It was done in two ways, but it was interpreted 
in a way that people would like to change it, that it
suits them. He knew his wrong. He knew of his 
shortcoming. It wasn't hidden. Just go through the 
real life of Jesus, through the original Jewish 
historical, historical books and literature. Not what
you read in the Catholics and Christians. History 
cannot be changed, because it's history, it's myth. 
And historians, Jewish historians have written 
about the life, 
(2:24). lifestyle of Christ, there and then. It's not 
written 200 years later, or 300 years later, with 
whatever they wanted. Jesus lived a very 
flamboyant, beautiful, young man, and he knew 
what is going to come. He knew, he was told by 2 
or 3 of his women companions, what their 
husbands were planning for him. He could have 
escaped. He could have left and gone somewhere 
else. He decided to stay because he... There's few 
reasons for it. One is that he thought he's 
untouchable. It would not happen, because the 
women loved him too much, they do something, 
but actually the pride of the man took over 
everything else. But on the other hand, he knew, 
and he knew what is, what will be the outcome. 
They gave him the option to leave Palestine. And 
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he took that option when he resurrected. And he 
went all the way to Spain. So, it wasn't unknown 
to him, and he knew he'll be put on the cross. It 
wasn't something decided overnight. He was 
aware through the lovers of what their husbands 
were negotiating with the Romans. Go through the
true history of Jesus and his time in Jerusalem and 
in Palestine. 
(2:26). And then you understand. Then there is no 
prejudice. Then it's not just because you read 
what's in the Bible. You read what is written as a 
history at that time. Because it's not tampered 
with. It's written by the Jewish historians. And he 
chose, I mean, he didn't have a choice. He never 
thought they'd put him on the cross, because, he 
wasn't the only one. They say, if you would have 
gone from Rome to Jerusalem, in those days, on 
the road where the Romans used to come and go, 
there was a lot of these crosses with bodies 
hanging off it. That was a way to do things, by the 
Romans. So, it wasn't the first time ever they made
a cross just for him. It was like a lampposts of 
those days. Telling people, "don't do anything 
against Rome." So, he knew what is going to be. 
He knew they're going to put him exactly where 
they put the others who went against anybody who
paid. If you paid any of the Roman generals or 
Roman military leaders, they would have put your 
mother on the cross, forget about Christ. You 
wanted to get rid of your mother-in-law, you pay 
the Romans for whatever, they put her on the cross
and they accused of her of anything she was, or 
she wasn't. So, cross wasn't something just for 
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Jesus, it was a normal way of punishment by the 
Romans. And it's well known, if you read the 
Jewish historical papers, books, it was done years 
before Christ, and it was done years after Christ. 
And many of the crosses, when the body fell off, 
whatever, were used for the next victim. 
(2:28). So, it's made very elaborate. But in fact it 
was a normal way. And usually the people who, 
they carry their own cross where they put it on. So,
what we hear, made so much glorious or whatever.
It was a normal "bread and butter" of the time for 
the Romans. As they always say, "potholes and 
crosses" came together because they used the 
pothole to eat till the body fell. If you know what a
pothole is, the Romans used chariots, and chariots 
made holes on the road. And so they put, where 
there was a big hole, they put a piece of steel to 
cover the hole that the chariots can go fast. And as 
they went, they made the shape of the hole (which 
was also the shape of a pot to cook with). And the 
Romans and the others pick it up and use it as a 
pot to cook it. So it became, as we know, the 
"pothole," because they made the pots for the 
cooking. So it's potholes and the process came the 
same together. And Jesus knew his destiny with 
what he was doing. When you mess around with 
other women, men’s wives, there's consequences. 
But when you play with too many, there are too 
many consequences. Read the Jewish historical 
books, or if you can get hold of, time of Christ. 
Then you see the two different interpretation, one 
is the reality of time written, and one is what is 
polished to become. And then you see he chose, he
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knew, and because he knew he had, what you call, 
like, dimension of what we call, 
(2:30). transmutation through the Soul. He knew 
what he can do, and when he received the 
knowledge, he did what it was to be done. He did 
what you are doing now, what we call, 
transportation and transmutation. He transported 
his own cross, when he came to it, he transmuted 
off the cross. And then, back into dimension of 
physicality. And then the same thing as I told you 
before. When you go to the Moon or when you 
land from New York in Tehran and you want to 
look like Iranian, in New York you were blonde 
blue, and then you look Iranian, nobody knows 
you're American, this is reality of the science, so 
now we understand the work of the Soul and the 
STP, and many of you will do it in the coming 
time, but no one can take the Soul away from it. 
And then, you see it. He had that opportunity and 
he changed his look that the Romans wouldn't 
recognize him. And he left with his daughter and 
his wife. But that part cannot be spoken to, but 
then you read the people who do "the walk" in 
Northern Spain, South of France. That's the path of
Jesus as a man. And he never spoke about his past.
What you call transmutation, what you call 
transmutation. And in a way Jesus is not the only 
one. Many men can do this and they've done in the
time of life. 
(2:32). At a point of, when you reduce the energy 
field of the STP, and the STM is still active 
through the circulation of the fields of the body of 
the Man, the transmuted Soul becomes prevalent, 
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and it takes over the physicality. And you can still 
be seen as a man, but the Soul is ?? not. We've 
seen that in the trials, what you call it, in the units 
(EU) in Austria, in the trials. Many of you went 
through this process, where Jesus went. And you 
chose to become a mermaid, if you heard a girl, 
half man, half fish. Many of you chose other 
things, many of you chose to see the Soul of the 
Christ or feel his presence. Now it's
 the reality, now we understand as a science. 
Where, then it was a mystery, because teachers 
like us, as Universal teachers, our job is to teach 
the truth, the knowledge. Then it's for Man to 
manipulate it, or creatures of the Universe, to 
manipulate it, to advance the elevation of their 
Soul. The whole purpose of the teaching, all these 
teachings to you and in the dimension of the Soul, 
to the other races of the Universe, is how you can 
facilitate faster to reach to the level of meeting, 
coming in touch with the "Soul of the Creator." 
Nothing else. There is no other purpose to this, 
because the love of the Creator, what's like to see, 
that it comes back to, is loved by. We are in a way, 
"love teachers," but for the Creator. 
(2:34). But, for those who doesn't know how to, is 
the way is, we know the recipe. And it doesn't 
come by heaven or hell, it comes by understanding
of the interaction of the fields. Go back to the 
teaching of last week, how I explained to you, you 
decide the dimension and direction of the travel, 
the way we do it in the physical life, the way we 
do it as a physical changing direction in running of
the man, and chasing a man himself, he decides 
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suddenly to turn, through the emotion or through 
the Soul. In the STP, if you understand the 
dimension of reaching the level of STP, which 
brings you to the Creator, and that's our job, 
nothing else. Then you understand. That's why I 
say, there are no, no, no, no, no, no whatever you 
call it, the name of. Whatever suits you, does not 
count. What is the reality counts. And you put any 
name, any shape, any position you like. Some of 
us reaches it, and some of us reaches at a given 
point, and some of us understand it and use it. And
like others, they say, "oh, I've been doing it." So, 
carry on doing it, it's good, at least you found 
elevation. So, you have to be mature to understand
what the teaching is about. It's not just about 
MaGrav. 
(2:36). We bring you in a way to understand how 
to elevate your STP, and then through it, 
understand how it works. That you can reach that 
point of maturity to reach your Creator. That's all. 
But, you don't need Messengers and you don't 
need Prophets. Any other question? 
Q: Dean .. Mr. Keshe, you've mentioned many 
things this morning. Thank you. One of the things 
I'd like to, for you to enhance, if possible, is, you 
say that we've only, in the public, we've received 
5% of the knowledge, of the Foundation. And so, 
the real knowledge, is this all being given to others
in the background, or is this in general, is this a 
Universal thing? How do you mean by this? 
K- We have a research development side, and we 
have a public knowledge side. Research and 
development is hundreds of years ahead of the 
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public knowledge. And we have shown the power 
of this to some of the world leaders in the recent 
past. We are not just sitting there like pretty faces. 
We teach the Knowledge Seekers who understand, 
convert it into a language of the Man, science of 
the Man. And then we deliver it to the world 
leaders, to bring that change. 
(2:38). And the knowledge in the hand of our 
Knowledge Seekers at the top, is hundreds of years
ahead of what you see in public as a Keshe 
Foundation knowledge. But, the world leaders 
understand the changes it brings. 
Q: Sorry to interrupt you. What was their reaction 
to this when you've shown them the knowledge? 
K- It is not a reaction. They... The world leaders 
have sided by (with) the Keshe Foundation, 
without a doubt. It's their job to come out, not for 
us. But as I said, we, when we were in China 
before the Corona situation, we had a gentleman, 
other gentleman in our offices, who came out of 
nowhere because of the situation we understood, 
and on a dinner table if I remember correctly, 
Wang Lin was present in that meeting. He said that
when the world leaders meet, Keshe Foundation is 
discussed. He said, I've been there when it's 
discussed. We are not the flavor of today. (They) 
are aware that the knowledge is there, and how we 
are teaching it. And it's for the benefit of their 
citizens, and their, what you call it, their structure. 
You've got to understand, we teach every 
Thursday. And as you know my teachings by now 
after nearly 500 sessions, there is no barriers to 
hold me back. Be it praising governments, world 

48



leaders, or literally, outright explaining and stating 
where we stand and where we are. As you heard a 
few minutes ago in that respect, 
(2:40). the interaction with the Iranian 
government, his Eminency Ayatollah Khamenei of
Iran, in interaction with the Keshe Foundation in 
the past few days and to come. We never hold 
back. But, would they know the knowledge is 
needed to be, because their scientists listen to it, 
their people listen to it, and they bring the change. 
And the Keshe Foundation, except one section, I 
think it's China or part of it, has never been 
banned, with all the red flags and the "firewalls" 
they put on. They allow us to teach, it's the same 
with Iran, it's the same with other countries. 
Because they know the knowledge is so correct, 
they know, but, when would the... In a way, if you 
look at it, they say, “okay, let him teach, let him 
take all the fire and the blame, and we take the 
benefits of it when it comes." We were in a 
meeting, very recently, and officials, government 
top officials from the government, they brought 
with them scientists, who they thought, they are 
the top, not that they know it's the top scientists, 
the government doesn't bring any scientists off the 
street, they brought their top scientists to, into a 
discussion. And, the minute one of the top 
scientists walked out of the lift (elevator), he said, 
"hello Mr. Keshe", and I couldn't recognize him, 
because of whatever, but our Knowledge Seeker 
recognized us, we met him there, and he was a 
Knowledge Seeker. And the officials were taken 
back, that how such a scientist at this level knows 
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and everything. And they didn't need to go into 
any more details of, because one of the top 
scientists they brought is already is a Knowledge 
Seeker. We didn't have to discuss anything. It was 
just to listen what they missed. 
(2:42). And, it’s the same structure, with other 
world leaders, other conditions. They leave us, as 
the Keshe Foundation, to teach you lot as 
Knowledge Seekers, for them to benefit from it, 
when it comes to it, but let him take the fire. We 
are aware of this for years. And so, it's not how 
their reaction is, they already reacted over years, 
by letting us be able to touch, to teach, and you 
don't see us being banned. No organization has 
taught like this, right across the nations, from the 
Communists, to non-Communists, to Kingship, to 
Presidency, to Democracy, freely. How many of 
you are from how many nations on the line today? 
From 100, 200 different nations and territories, 
from every corner of this planet, and every 
Thursday, you know it's there, and you come to it. 
It's the job of your governments, to come up with 
what they have done, or what they are doing with 
the knowledge they receive. We don't look at their 
reaction. The reaction speaks with what you are 
here, We channel, we teach from sunrise to sunset, 
from China to Los Angeles. From Shanghai to Los 
Angeles, going around the Earth. Some of you are 
from Shanghai, some of you are from Los Angeles
on the line. Some of you from Europe, from Iran, 
and every other nation in between. And nobody 
has stopped you listening to the teaching. As I 
said, we were in a meeting recently, with one of 

50



the most influential man, in one of the biggest 
countries in the world, he said, the scientist said, 
(2:44). "we know, and Newton know on this and 
that, this goes against it." He said, "now we write a
new book of science, let them come to us. This is 
what it is, and we take the knowledge from now 
on." So, the world leaders have made their 
decisions where we going ??. We don't look for 
reaction, the reaction speaks for past 10 years of 
me being able to teach every Thursday. 
Q: Mr. Keshe is it the same when you speak with 
the religious leaders? Theology? Do you get a 
different response totally? Or is it the scientists 
from the Theology? Is it a mix? 
K- Ah! We had both, we get all of them. We... I 
have no limitation, there is no boundaries with it. 
Some of the Knowledge Seekers are here, when 
we sat with the Vatican people. And some of the 
Knowledge Seekers are here, when we talked to 
the most religious, religious people, who are in 
high positions today in the Iranian government, as 
Mullahs and Ayatollahs. I had a reference sent to 
me by our people in Tehran. This guy who is now 
the head of this, this, the highest rank in Iran is in 
the news everywhere. He said, Mr. Keshe, you 
already spoken to him two or three times. He 
knows you. And now he's become to this position. 
He follows us. He knows our position and stand. 
We talk to the people who are in power, and ?? 
who come into power. One of our Knowledge 
Seekers is a very, very close, top advisors to one of
the world leaders who's just been re-elected. And 
he works through us to the world leader. 
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(2:46). One of the recently re-elected world 
presidents, his literally closest advisor is a 
Knowledge Seeker. We meet frequently, regularly 
with each other. And he takes the knowledge 
across to the government. Then the ?? patent, it 
has to work for them. So we don't look, we don't 
see. We are in the roots of it. We are in… we 
taught so much freely that we have touched the 
Soul of many. So, it's not that Knowledge Seekers,
but they're regularly, every week, they learn about 
it, they use it. And that's all it counts to me, that 
positive change. Doesn't matter how and where. 
Q: That seems to be the beauty of what you've 
been teaching, Mr. Keshe, is that understanding 
that it's from any Soul, are all equal, and higher, 
and lower. And that is the real beauty. That when 
you touch the Soul, it is a different, different field 
strength totally.
 And it makes people humble. And that is the real 
beauty of it. That really is quite special. 
K- The reality is you Knowledge Seekers, who 
carry it. I come from a very typical, unique family 
structure. And my mother always told me, no one 
should know who you are when you walk out of 
the house. Where your bloodline comes from and 
who you're connected to is in your head and not on
your clothes and in your mouth. And she lived that
way, and we all, we live that way. 
(2:48). And three, four years ago when I was in 
Italy, one of my own close members of my family, 
at a dining table, very close, extremely close to 
me, she said, "you are not from there, how come 
we don't know?" I said, "you don't know a lot who 
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we are." The Keshe Foundation is not me, is all of 
us. And we all behave the same, we teach freely, 
we do our best to share the knowledge, and when 
it becomes, as a guy said on the CNN, I believe it, 
when it comes to CNN, you all will say, "oh, we 
are there." But, it needs its time. Even today, we 
have been working since 4 or 5 o'clock in the 
morning. We receive so much support and people 
who are not even Knowledge Seekers, but they 
want to see this technology, on... to bring the 
change. And they're working on it, we... we just... 
not battle, we just work, continuously, 20, 22 
hours a day, sometimes, to make sure it happens. 
In past 3 months, I've lived more out of suitcase, 
than actually being home. But you all received the 
teaching without knowing where we are. 
Sometimes we change the teaching time, because 
there are important meetings with officials, 
governments and other things that cannot be 
changed. So, it's better to change the Knowledge 
Seeker teaching, than trying to move there at 
another time. I literally, three, past three months, 
four months, lived out of the suitcase. And even 
just landed last night home, just for a few hours. 
(2:50). And we are again up in the next few days. I
have found peace in my private life. And that has 
allowed me to bring Keshe Foundation, in the past 
3, 4 years, to where it is. What I was looking for 
life, all my life, I have received and I'm thankful 
for it. And it allows me to serve fully. And there's 
nobody to destroy it from underneath, 
continuously. So, it's you as Knowledge Seekers 
and us to set the course for their next step, that is 
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bringing such a beauty in world leaders decision, 
and in economical ?? situation, and everything 
else. Yesterday I had a call from one of our top 
man in Keshe Foundation, that they came to him 
and gave him some information, I said, it's correct,
from the government. Because, they know we 
work correctly with, when we do with 
governments. You don't think if they accept or they
don't. The acceptance of Keshe Foundation, really 
teaching and me still, openly as a, you have to 
understand, very, very important position. I think 
it's more important than anything else, sometimes I
look at it. With all the sanctions on Iran, with all 
the 80 million Iranians suffering for nuclear 
technology of Iran, me as an Iranian, an Iranian 
passport holder, 
(2:52). still travel the span of the planet, and 
welcomed by open arms, by all the nations. And 
we still in 10 years we are teaching, and nobody 
has stopped us, nobody has walked in, you can't 
teach, they haven't closed our Zoom session, they 
haven't closed our other session. So, we are doing 
something right, but let the guy take the bullet then
us, let him teach, and when it works out, we'll take
the credit, we don't mind. If this is the way to 
bring peace and knowledge, let it be. Doesn't 
matter who brings it and who goes on the cross. 
We walked away once from the cross, with the 
new life it won't be the first time. Any other 
question? 
Q: Just very quickly Mr. Keshe, the picture that's 
on the screen, is the AI doing a good job? Is this 
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dome, does it sense to you, about anything that 
real? 
K- I don't know where it comes from, these are the
new imagination from Rick, and the people he 
worked with in the background. 
R: Yeah, I just wanted a picture of aliens in ... ... or
an alien background with humans as well meeting. 
And it's somehow generated this image and I said, 
"that's close enough, I'll take it." So... It makes it 
really easy as an artist. You just ask for what you 
want, and you choose from four images, if you like
one of them, you can expand on it a bit, or 
whatever. And it's not exactly accurate or 
anything, 
(2:54). but it gives an impression, it gives an idea, 
or it can inspire others to think of it, in other 
directions, or whatever. So, it is what it is, I'm not 
sure what to think of it yet. 
K- Which is an alien and which one is a human? 
R: Well that's the thing, some of these beings at the
bottom have like three legs and tails and funny 
things on their arms and what not. I'm not sure, 
some of them look like trees and walking trees and
that kind of thing. So, I guess all types of beings 
under the rainbow. If you think we have an 
identity crisis now, wait till the future. 
Q: Did you think Rick that the AI is Earth based? 
It seems to be like the landscape of the Earth in the
background. 
K- No, many planets look like this, it's not just 
Earth. Mars has such a features, Moon has such a 
features. Wherever the magnetic fields and the, 
what you call it, the Soul of the Planet, and its STP
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and in the dimension it is, moves, you see these 
structures. It's not unique. 
R: Do they have rainbows and other planets? 
K- Everything else, yes. I received a very beautiful
thing, I think it's from Azar, someone recently. 
Emirates airline is trying to promote tourism, and 
it says, "this is not such and such a country, this is 
this country, this is not such and such a country, 
this is this country." And, so we have images of, 
we have to get the same thing in the same places, 
not. 
(2:56). So, it is, this image can be anywhere in the 
Universe. 
Q: I remember you saying Mr. Keshe about there 
will come a time, place and position where you 
will have like centers or places where you will go 
as a human to learn how to experience another 
atmosphere, another dimension, another planet, 
you know, another field strength. .. Is this still 
relevant? 
K- This is very relevant and very soon we invite 
you to these places. Maybe in next 3 to 5 years. 
This kind of space environment will be brought 
into reality and working condition within the next 
3 years, 5 years. We have... the reason I tell you 
this is not something we dream. We have signed 
into it. We have signed agreements to develop 
such a center. It's going to cost huge amount of 
money, but the governments have committed 
themselves to it. Because we have to do it to be 
able to colonize. We have to see what it is and 
what we become of, and how it will effect us, 
before we commit millions, hundreds of thousands
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of people into a new condition, into space. It's not 
if it's relevant, it's Keshe Foundation and it's 
management has signed themselves into a 
structure of such a thing. You will hear about it, it's
the job of the government to announce it, but in a 
near future, this is a reality, 
(2:58). this is what we will be working on in the 
coming months and years, to build such a 
structure, not in a one room, but in a huge space, 
to see how people interact, how people do. And we
learned a lot from the lockdowns of the Corona 
time. Psychological behavior of lockdowns. Or 
psychological behavior of a large number of 
people in a dome. Do we need to create jobs for 
them? And do we need to keep them busy? Do we 
allow them to live in different dimensions? The 
Corona has brought a lot of knowledge to the 
structures like Keshe Foundation, NASA, and 
space agencies and working on colonization. How 
people look, live in an open space, but they're 
locked down in a space. You can go shopping, but 
such and such time. To you, it's just something you
went through, but people like us, we study this 
very, very thoroughly. Social behavior in a large 
structure in space. And we've seen how people 
behave. For the love of, fear of their own life, and 
secondly for protecting the others. We stay in, and 
we work from home. We don't need to go to the 
offices. And now we see that pattern following 
after the Corona. Many, many, many offices 
around the world are empty, because you don't 
need an office when you can work on your bed, 
and be more efficient than you going in there, 
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somebody paying the rent, the lights and 
everything else, for you to do your work. It's very, 
very interesting. If you understand the changes 
which has come in social behavior, to you is 
something you could just go through. 
(3:00). If you go through the airports nowadays, if 
you go to the airports before Corona, you had so 
many desks, and so many people sitting in it. So, 
they had to go, because of the Corona there was no
passengers. So, in this meantime, a lot of airports 
have upgraded to none, what you call it, physical 
body presence ... Now, before you had to go, wait 
in line, do the check-in, they give you a ticket, 
then the lady takes your suitcase, and everything 
else. If you go, we've been doing it for a few 
times, in past few months, as I said, through us in 
Vienna airport. You… there is… all the desks are 
empty. Maybe one or two people are sitting there. 
If there is something needed to be done, all the 
human workers have gone. There's a machine. You
put your code in, the barcode. It gives you a ticket 
for your luggage. You go to where you used to see 
the lady to put your luggage in. You put your 
luggage on there. There's a machine that reads it. 
Take your suitcase, and you go. There is no human
interaction. And if you go to a lot of airports 
nowadays, you have to open your suitcase, take 
computers out, and all that. And there is so many 
people standing there. If you go to like Amsterdam
airport, now they brought the system. You don't 
open anything. You just put your luggage and 
everything on the belt, and it goes through. So all 
those mayhems
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 we had, now is solved. And there's less need for 
human interaction. Where did all these jobs go to? 
What do these hundreds of people sitting behind 
the counters, hundreds of people checking your 
luggage and opening, take your bag out, what 
happened to them? When you go to Amsterdam 
airport, you just put your suitcase with 10 
telephones and 20 computers in it on the belt, 
(3:02). and it comes out to their end. If they have a
question, they ask. They see everything you have 
inside. And it's two men. What happened to all 
tens of people, do this, do that, checking you in? 
So we see the change of social structure. We see 
there is no need for offices to work with. So you 
can actually live on the moon and work for an 
insurance company on Earth. That's how it's going 
to be. And with the new present communication 
system, which we have developed now, is actually 
used as of this week by our doctors, it's 
instantaneous through the Soul. So you can 
actually work with the computers on Earth 
instantaneously. The new wireless structure of 
Soul interactions in the physical dimension has 
gone into trial by our doctors in the past few days. 
And we'll see how effective it will become, and 
how it works in the next few weeks. So there is 
less need and need to be. And what are we going 
to do with all this unemployment? What happened 
to all those hundreds of ladies behind the counter 
checking you in? And there had to be three shifts 
of them, because the airport is open 24 hours a 
day. Now, it's two people, check you in, done. I 
think the next step, it's like when you go now to 
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the hotels. You had a butler and you had somebody
who come and check you in, and, or if you had 
baggage, or something. If you walk in the, what 
we call, the hotels nowadays, most of the hotels, 
they have a, what we call, robot. There's a package
for room number so and so, they just put in the 
robot, the robot goes, delivers and come back. 
(3:04). You don't need that human butler, that 
whatever. The tipping time of 10 dollars by the 
Americans is over. 
Q: Mr. Keshe, can I ask you a question quickly 
about that? So, would it be better that, or how will 
it be? Will it... the teachings to be present 
somewhere else, will it be from other Souls that 
are present in that environment? Or will it be 
through Souls present here on planet Earth? How 
will that interaction work? Who would be the best 
teacher of this? 
K- Oh, every one of us. Depends whose Soul you 
are, as a strength of. You know this is one of the 
biggest thing nobody can claim. As I said, "there is
nobody king, I'm the best teacher." No, we... it 
depends how we teach and to what level we reach 
to teach. Some of us are good in making Gans’s 
and we got stuck with it. Some of us now are in a 
different level. One of our biggest problem now is 
to put a group together of Knowledge Seekers, 
who can jump from where they are and they think 
they are the best in Knowledge Seekers in the 
Keshe Foundation, to where we really are in 
research. Some of my present problem is, how do I
bring somebody from the first class to the sixth 
class? And would they understand it? The 
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development and knowledge gap in Keshe 
Foundation is so huge, what is in public and what 
is in research and development and understanding 
of it, that at the moment is one of my biggest 
headaches. Very few people understand very few 
parts. And at the same time, we try to guide, to put 
the other things together. 
(3:06). We try to train the others to come in. We've
got no Knowledge Seekers, but working with the 
Knowledge Seekers who start understanding the 
structure, in three different countries, four different
countries, working at the same time. And trying to 
bring all this, and bring in Knowledge Seekers 
who thought, "oh, I'm making Gans’s, and I did 
this and I put some patches there." And when you 
come to see what reality the knowledge and the 
development physically is in the Keshe 
Foundation, what would they think? Would they 
back off, or would they jump, or they think 
suddenly they are God? Or would they be holding 
like the others till we are ready to mass teach? One
of the biggest problem to jump to the next level, 
what we see in next few years, is, as I said to the 
officials in past few weeks, is to teach the Keshe 
Foundation technology in mass media on 
televisions, physically for people to go through it. 
And then, which of you Knowledge Seekers, who 
are stuck with Gans’s and the others, will jump to 
energy, will jump to magnetic field transfer? This 
is one of the biggest problem. Our problem is not 
technological development, our problem is, how 
many Knowledge Seekers we can take across this 
threshold of advancement, which is kept in 3 or 4 
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groups around the world, and the present 
Knowledge Seekers who think they know 
everything and they can teach. There's so many 
ways, certain things, you can teach how to make 
Gans’s. But what's next? And then when you do 
that, what is next? How do we interact with the 
Soul? How do we interact? 
(3:08). How do we explain to the top scientists, not
the Soul, but this energy envelope. Because to me, 
this is the only way they understand nowadays, till
we come to the... they mature enough to 
understand the Soul. How do we deal with this 
energy envelope? That we put you in it. Called 
your Soul, carrying your STP. And how do we 
transmute you? How many of you can we 
transmute at the same time? Do we need that 
master trustee, that we put all family in one, all the
company heads in one, and then we take them to 
moon in one go, or do we shuttle them one at a 
time? These are not talk of dreams, this is actually 
going through the process of different part of the 
Keshe Foundation, scientists who work on it. How
do we mutate energy into matter and matter back 
into energy? And we get the same thing back, we 
put an orange, we get an orange, we don't put an 
orange and we get an apple. 
Q: .. Can I just quickly say. So, many of the 
Knowledge Seekers, you've given the knowledge, 
a lot of knowledge, a substantial amount of 
knowledge. And it's been able to decipher the bits 
you need to put the puzzle together to be able to 
transmute it to so you can use it, you know to go 
into the dimension of plasma, real plasma. And I 

62



think many Knowledge Seekers do this when they 
openly receive the knowledge and they make the 
Gans’s or they make them the matter states. And 
then when they start delivering it back to people to
pass the knowledge on then they are transferring 
transmuting the knowledge into plasma again. So, 
they're receiving it on a Soul level. 
(3:10). Is this your understanding? Is this what... 
K- It is partially, but we've seen teaching 
Knowledge Seekers in a very special way. And 
then when they see, they learn, they do, they 
suddenly break off and they don't... they 
disconnect from the Keshe Foundation. That it's 
their knowledge and they start working and doing 
things. We've seen that with the doctor in 
Washington. I spent a lot of time teaching him, 
hoping that he will come to what it is. And once he
learned, he thought, "now I don't need the Keshe 
Foundation, and don't want anybody to know I'm 
using their technology." You know exactly what 
I'm talking about. And he's still in doldrums of, 
what do you call it, rotating reactors and all that 
rubbish, which now he thinks he is. We taught 
many people, a number of Knowledge Seekers, to 
bring them up. We trusted that they will share their
knowledge. But now it's become money making, 
profitable business, that's all I'm caring about. But 
they pay for it. They pay through their Soul for 
betraying their own Soul. Don't look at the short 
term, look at the long term, what is going to come 
up. We don't stop teaching, doesn't matter who. 
But then the trust comes. As I always say, we test 
the heat of the fire with gold. Is it hot enough to 
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melt the gold, like melting your heart? And we test
the man greed with the same gold. If you still carry
?? this gold, it's just there to serve a purpose. Or it 
takes over your time, and it's, what I call, glare, 
blinds the man. And we've seen that with many, 
many Knowledge Seekers. We had a Universal 
Council member, 
(3:12). I remember walking in Italy, with them. 
And they were not from a country, they were 
Universal Councils in the country they adopted. 
And he said, "we don't need the Keshe 
Foundation, because it brings us a lot of business 
for us, on our website. We sell all the products, we 
are connected." And I said, "You got to ?? get out 
of the Universal Council." So, let it be. The 
knowledge does not belong to us. We are just 
teachers. But we have to observe that it does not 
fall in the same path as before. It is, it has a higher 
value, it's a time for a change. And that change has
to come through understanding that no gold has no
value. But the elevation of the Soul has, that's the 
gold. And then you leave it to the others. 
Q: Mr. Keshe, the Knowledge Seekers that receive
this knowledge though, that are becoming the 
teachers and giving this knowledge, they, as 
you've spoken about Christ, Jesus Christ and other 
prophets, ... the knowledge as you've done this 
time, is shared among, equally amongst man, and 
many around the planet. So, isn't the elevation of 
all these Souls, as one Soul, ... are, you know, 
bringing about the change within inside 
themselves? So, the change is present in this 
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moment. You've delivered the ... you've delivered 
it, it's in position. 
K- We have not even delivered 1% of the 
knowledge. But if 1% makes some people think 
they are God, 
(3:14). so you can imagine if we give 1% and they 
got 1 millionth of that 1% and they think God, 
imagine what they feel when they get the 1%. And 
then how would they share it? You understand? 
This is the problem. But, that’s that fire. Let's see 
who melts with it. 
K- .. Shall we call it a day? 
R: Sure, if you wish Mr. Keshe. 
K- If we have another question I can hear. 
R: Well, we have a hand up with Salomea, but
 if you feel it's time to end, then we can do that. 
We've gone for quite a while here. 
K- We haven't heard from her for a long time. Let's
see what she has to praise herself for. Come on. 
Let's hear, listen to her. 
Q: To praise me? Myself? I praise you, Mr. Keshe.
K- Carry on. 
Q: It's my free day, you know. I'm busy with my 
home. And I'm not allowed and I don't have any 
possibility to be in contact with your Zoom and 
I'm so sad. But today is the day of the children, of 
the child. I am the child of the Universe. So, do 
you remember the letter which I wrote to all 
Knowledge Seekers from your Zoom, I also sent to
my old colleagues, including ministers and 
director general, and they sent to European Union. 
(3:16). And next day, I have seen the concept of 
sustainable peace included in a sustainable 
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development strategy of this institution, because I 
sent on 9 May, it was a day of Europe. And this is 
an example how our wish can become a reality if 
we elevate our Soul. And I think that elevation of 
the Soul is the key, as you said, to us to reach and 
manifest all what we want. And now the question 
to you. What is the key to elevate the Soul at the 
level of the Creator from the Keshe Foundation 
point of view? 
K- What you mean? 
Q: What I mean? 
K- Can I just answer something? There's a very 
nice questions appeared in questions in the 
webinar chat. It's from one of our Knowledge 
Seekers. Says, "and what do I do with the car 
washing?" Start washing UFOs, it'll be more 
profitable. There is no need for cars. And if you 
can find a washing machine or washing system for
Souls, you're quite welcome, we'll teach you how 
to do it. Carry on. 
Q: So, we have to wash our Soul, in order to 
become equal with the Creator, maybe. 
K- We don't need wash, it's just becoming humble 
enough to receive. 
Q: Yeah, okay, you said to me, to become humble 
enough. 
(3:18). Thank you very much, this is the one 
answer I was looking for. 
K- Thank you very much. Shall we call it the day 
Rick? .. It's nearly three and a half hours. 
R: Yeah. Ok, well thank you Mr. Keshe for another
Knowledge Seekers Workshop here. Is there 
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anything else you need to announce or we should 
say before we end here? 
K- The Knowledge Seekers tomorrow, who did the
session of the elevation of the Soul of the victims 
of child abuse, we will meet you tomorrow, if you 
have already registered for it. And hopefully, some
of you have managed to raise that curtain, and 
raise, and understand how to do it. And bring that 
illusion of separation of the Soul from STP away 
from it, that we can raise the Soul of, and the, what
we call, the abusers. The main target of our work 
will be the nation leaders, who promote this, live 
through it. And we'll see how we get through and 
we achieve this. I have to thank all the Knowledge 
Seekers in the background, who work and done 
things over years, that you brought us to this 
position where we are today. It is not one 
individual, each one of us, some people have come
and gone. And some people are still here after 
years working. It would not be built to what it is, if
it was, because all of us putting a brick in the wall.
And how that brick has hold the wall, and 
sometime, it's been a good way, but even if it's 
been a bad way, it has turned out to be good for all
of us. 
(3:20). I thank you for all your work and all your 
support, being physically, morally, Soul wise. We 
somehow, we got where we got and we still got a 
long way to go yet. Thank you very much and see 
some of you tomorrow and otherwise next week. 
And we'll come to the point where we hope that 
we reach through the Soul to all those on this 
planet and beyond and not through just Internet 
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and television. Thank you very much Rick for all 
your support. 488 KSW June 1, 2023 END

68


	Part I: Teaching
	Part II: Q&A

